"{k CedarRapids
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Current Organization: Cedar Rapids Community School District &=

Home ltems Documents Vendors Quick Buy
Bid Tabulation for Bid #00001478
Quotes Revisions Items Header Questions Subcontractors Routing Attachments Score Summary Back to Bid

o Each bid items can only be awarded to one vendor.

# of Quotes per page:

Total Item Count: 66

Sort by, Quote Total

V| [Ascending v

Total Awardable Quote Count: @

1-25 of 66
123

Item
Index:

' o Please make sure that you save your changes before you navigate to another page.

2BO - Bid Opened (Quotes received and opened. Ready for tabulation)

Bid Status:

Cancel Item info/Quote info (oooo7912)Barnard  (00001398)MIDWEST (00003742)K&S
Instrument Repair MUSICAL Music Inc
<Quote: IMPORTS <Quote:
00006483> <Quote: 00006486>
00006489>
Adams P2KG23 23" No Bid No Bid No Bid
Professional Generation If NB NB NB
Smooth Copper Timpani with
Cover
ftem #:1 Print
Sequence:1.0 Status:2BO -
Opened
Quantity:1.0 Uom:EA
Double Bass Outfit, 3/4, No Bid No Bid O $1,879.00
Schultz SSPS102B34, NB NB Discount: 0%
German Carbon Composite Alternate Description:
Bow, Helicore Strings, Meisel Mozart 8700X
Adjustable Height Bridge Add to Original
and...View Dt_etall Descrintion
ltem #:2  Print Replace Original
Sequence:2.0 Status:2BO - Description
Opened
Quantity:1.0 Uom:EA
Yamaha YMRD2400C 4.3 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Octave Marimba NB NB NB

Item #:3 Print

(00007336)Schultz
Strings Inc
<Quote:
00006481>

No Bid
NB

® $2,000.00
Discount: 0%

No Bid
NB

e}

(00007931)
Sweetwater Music
Education
Technology
<Quote:
00006484>

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

O $5,360.00
Discount: 0%

Basic Purchasing

Department Access

Page 1 of 5

Internal Administrator

November 23,2021 7:4828 AMCST Q@ 4l 7 € & = >

(00008148)Steve {00008233)
Weiss Music Washington Music
<Quote: Center
00006485> <Quote:
00006488>
O $3,139.00 O $3,078.15
Discount; 0% -
Discount: 0%
No Bid No Bid
NB NB
O $4,996.00

Discount: 0%

(00010733)Music &
Arts Centers
<Quote:
00006487>

O s$3,416.84
Discount: 0%

No Bid
NB

O $5,832.99
Discount: 0%

Kathy Kinley

(00005682)West
Music Company
Inc
<Quote:
00006482>

® 33237.00
Discount: 0%

O $1,546.00
|
Discount: 0%
Alternate Description:
Krutz 100 Series
Add to Original
Description
Replace Original
Description

@® $5,340.00
Discount: 0%



Sequence:3.0 Status:2BO -
Opened
Quantity:2.0 Uom:EA

Faxx 6.5AL Small Bore
Trombone Mouthpiece Kit
Iltem #:4 Print
Sequence:4.0 Status:2BO -
Opened

Quantity:3.0 Uom:EA

Faxx 7C Trumpet
Mouthpiece

ltem #:5 Print
Sequence:5.0 Status:2BO -
Opened

Quantity:3.0 Uom:EA

Alto Saxophone Accent
AST712L, with Case,
Mouthpiece & Neck Strap
Item #:6 Print
Sequence:6.0 Status:2BO -
Opened

Quantity:1.0 Uom:EA

Alto Saxophone Prelude by
Conn-Selmer AS711, with
Case

ltem #:7 Print
Sequence:7.0 Status:2BO -
Opened

Quantity:1.0 Uom:EA

Baritone Saxophone Yamaha
YBSS52

Item #:8 Print
Sequence:8.0 Status:2BO -
Opened

Quantity:1.0 Uom:EA

Baritone Saxophone
Mouthpiece, Ottp Link Hard
Rubber 5 Star

Item #:9 Print
Sequence:9.0 Status:2BO -
Opened

Quantity:1.0 Uom:EA

Bass Clarinet Yamaha
YCL221 with Mouthpiece and
Case

Item #:10 Print
Sequence:10.0 Status:2BO

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

® $4,000.00

[ T

Discount: 0%
Alternate Description:
Store Demo - Like New

Add to Original
Description
Replace Original
Description
No Bid
NB
No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

O $638.00

ns
Discount: 0%

O $4,395.00

Discount: 0%
Alternate Description:
New Model # YBS-480
Add to Original
Description
Replace Original
Description

No Bid
NB

O $1,839.00
Discount: 0%

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

O $605.00
[T
Discount: 0%
Alternate Description:
RS Berkeley USA54
Add to Original
Description
Replace Original
Description

O $670.00
Discount: 0%
Alternate Description:
RS Berkeley ALS501
Add to Original

Description
Replace Original
Description
No Bid
NB
No Bid
NB
No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

® 352934

L |
Discount: 0%

O s21.79
Discount: 0%

No Bid
NB

O s$729.00
Discount: 0%

No Bid
NB

O $149.20
Discount: 0%

O $2,117.00
Discount: 0%

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

O $4,828.55
[ ] ]
Discount: 0%

O $33.95

Discount: 0%

O $25.00
Discount: 0%

No Bid
NB

O s653.50
Discount: 0%

O $4,319.30
Discount: 0%

O $284.00
Discount: 0%

O $1,789.55
[ 7]
Discount: 0%

O $33.56
Discount: 0%

® $20.00
[ L]
Discount: 0%

No Bid
NB

O s741.30
Discount: 0%

O $5,534.15
Discount: 0%
Alternate Description:
YBS480
Add to Original
Description
Replace Original
Description

® s$116.98
[ ]
Discount: 0%

O $2,289.02
Discount: 0%
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O $37.9
Discount: 0% |

O $26.49 ‘
Discount: 0%

® $750.00
Discount: 0%

® 3$696.00
Discount: 0%

O $4,630.00
Discount: 0%

Alternate Description:
YBS52 discontinued -
Now YBS480

Add to Original
Description

Replace Original
Description

O s$150.95
Discount: 0%

® 3$1,916.00
Discount: 0%



- Opened
Quantity:1.0 Uom:EA

Bass Drum Beater, Encore Al
Payson B3 General
Percussion Source

Item #:11  Print
Sequence:11.0 Status:2BO
- Opened

Quantity:1.0 Uom:EA

Bass Drum with Suspended
Stand, Pearl PBM-2814S
Item #:12 Print
Sequence:12.0 Status:2BO
- Opened

Quantity:1.0 Uom:EA

Bass Rosin, Pop's

Item #:13 Print
Sequence:13.0 Status:2BO
- Opened

Quantity:3.0 Uom:EA

Bell Kit Set, Yamaha SKB350
with Bells, Practice Pad,
Mallets, Sticks, Stand,
Backpack

Item #:14 Print
Sequence:14.0 Status:2BO
- Opened

Quantity:9.0 Uom:EA

Bells, Musser Model M645
Item #:16 Print
Sequence:15.0 Status:2BO
- Opened

Quantity:1.0 Uom:EA

Cello Bow, 3/4 size, Schultz
CARBNCMPCL43,
Refurbished SSPS101
Carbon Composite Bows
Item #:16 Print -
Sequence:16.0 Status:2BO
- Opened

Quantity:1.0 Uom:EA

Cello Bow, 4/4 size, Schultz
CARBNCMPCL44
Refurbished SSPS101
Carbon Composite Bow
item #:17 Print
Sequence:17.0 Status:2BO
- Opened

Quantity:1.0 Uom:EA

Cello Strings, D'Addario
Helicore,4/4 size, Full Set
includes (1)A, (1)D, (1)G, (1)C

in oach cat

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

O s10.00

Discount: 0%

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

® $45.00

[ [ ]
Discount: 0%

® s45.00

[ E
Discount: 0%

QO $106.00
Discount: 0%

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

O $10.99
Discount: 0%

O s212.30
Discount: 0%

O $1,235.09
Discount: 0%

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

O $120.30
Discount: 0%

@ $22.00

[ [ ]
Discount: 0%

O $1,558.00
Discount: 0%

No Bid
NB

® s179.00
F T ]
Discount: 0%

® $1,107.00

am
Discount: 0%

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

O $1,528.15
ak
Discount: 0%

® s6.85

[ 1§
Discount: 0%

O s199.95

Discount: 0%
Alternate Description:
SBK-350
Add to Original
Description
Replace Original
Description

O $1,133.00
Discount: 0%

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

O $5145

Discount: 0%

O $31.99
Discount: 0%

O ¢1,840.37
Discount: 0%

O s9.95
Discount: 0%

O 3210.00
Discount: 0%

O $1,173.34
Discount: 0%

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

O $133.49
Discount: 0%

Page 3 of 5

O $2950
Discount: 0%

® $1,665.00
Discount: 0%

O s$11.26
Discount: 0%

O $230.00
Discount: 0% |

O $1,255.00
Discount: 0%

O $52.00
Discount: 0%

Alternate Description:

Add to Original
Description
Replace Original
Description

O ¢52.00
Discount: 0%

Alternate Description:

Add to Original
Description

Replace Original
Description ‘

® 54319
3]
Discount: 0%



Item #:18 Print
Sequence:18.0 Status:2BO
- Opened

Quantity:1.0 Uom:SET

Cello, 3/4 size, Schultz
SSPS101CL34, Refurbished
Performer Series 101 Cello
Outfit

Item #:19 Print
Sequence:19.0 Status:2BO
- Opened

Quantity:1.0 Uom:EA

Cello, 4/4 size, Schultz
SSPS100CL44 Performer
Series 100 Cello Outfit - Fully
Laminate

Item #:20 Print
Sequence:20.0 Status:2BO
- Opened

Quantity:1.0 Uom:EA

Clarinet Mouthpiece Fobes
Debut Bb Mouthpiece

Item #:21 Print
Sequence:21.0 Status:2BO
- Opened

Quantity:2.0 Uom:EA

Concert Snare Drum,
Yamaha CSM-1450All, 14x5"
Maple

Item #:22 Print
Sequence:22.0 Status:2BO
- Opened

Quantity:1.0 Uom:EA

Double F Horn Accent
HR711L with Case and
Mouthpiece

Item #:23 Print
Sequence:23.0 Status:2BO
- Opened

Quantity:1.0 Uom:EA

Euphonium, Yamaha Model
YEP-201 with Mouthpiece
and Case

Item #:24 Print
Sequence:24.0 Status:2BO
- Opened

Quantity:1.0 Uom:EA

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

O s35.00
Discount: 0%

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

O $1,485.00
Discount: 0%

No Bid
NB

O $650.00
[ 1]
Discount: 0%
Alternate Description:
Meisel Mozart 3000C

Add to Original

Description
Replace Original
Description
No Bid
NB
No Bid
NB
O $1,400.00

Discount: 0%
Alternate Description:
RS Berkeley FR812
Add to Original
Description
Replace Original
Description

No Bid
NB

® $750.00
.
Discount: 0%

® $650.00
[ | ]
Discount: 0%

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

O $1,690.00
Discount: 0%

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

® s385.00

[ I']
Discount: 0%

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

Alternate Description:
GL1370 (might be
problem per vendor)
Add to Original
Description

Replace Original
Description

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

O s$29.00
Discount: 0%

O $390.05
Discount: 0%

No Bid
NB

O 142485
[ 1]
Discount: 0%

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

® 2722

[ T
Discount: 0%

O $460.00
Discount: 0%

No Bid
NB

O s$1,721.95
Discount: 0%

Page 4 of 5

O $1,082.00
Discount: 0%
Alternate Description:
Krutz 100, New
Add to Original
Description
Replace Original
Description

O s903.00

Discount: 0%
Alternate Description:
Krutz 100, New
Add to Original
Description
Replace Original
Description

O 33045
Discount: 0%

O s435.00
Discount: 0%

® $1,347.00
[ 0]
Discount: 0%

@ $1,528.00
Discount: 0%



Page 5 of 5

Flute, Trevor James Model No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid O $434.27 ® $284.00
10XC with Case NB NB NB NB NB NB NB Discount: 0% e
Item #:25 Print Discount: 0%
Sequence:25.0 Status:2BO
- Opened |
Quantity:4.0 Uom:EA
Totals: $Vendor Gross Total: $4,000.00 $9,057.00 $16,710.00 $19,036.00 $21,490.12 $21,926.00 $32,525.30 $40,549.46 $64,028.48
$ Vendor Discount: $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
$ Vendor Net Total: $4,000.00 $9,057.00 $16,710.00 $19,036.00 $21,490.12 $21,926.00 $32,525.30 $40,549.46 $64,028.48 ‘
$ Preference Discount: $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
$ Evaluation Total: wu $4,000.00 $9,057.00 $16,710.00 $19,036.00 $21,490.12 $21,926.00 $32,525.30 $40,549.46 $64,028.48
$ Vendor Freight: $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
$ Awarded: $4,000.00 $0.00 $0.00 $3,490.00 $88.02 $3,125.00 $20.55 $231.42 $22,998.19 |
Eval Codes: NI NI NI Ni NI NI NI NI
Pref Codes:
Award/Unaward All Award Al | Award Al | | Award Al Award Al Award Al | | Award Al }\ Award Al _‘ | AwardAl l © AwadAl |
Unaward All ' i Unaward All ! ' Unaward All | Unaward All | Unaward All ‘ Unaward All Unaward All | Unaward All Unaward All |
Evaluation Code Descriptions:
ma = Lowest item Price or Lowest Evaluation Quote Total NB = No Bid
NI = Did Not Bid All ltems
Cancel ltems | | Save & Continue |

Copyright © 2021 Periscope Holdings, Inc. - All Rights Reserved. default
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Cedar Rapids
Community School District

NIGP Code Browse | My Account | Customer Service | About

Current Organization: Cedar Rapids Community School District &=

Quick Buy

Home ltems Documents Vendors
Bid Tabulation for Bid #00001478
Quotes  Revisions ltems Header Questions Subcontractors Routing Attachments Score Summary

) Each bid items can only be awarded to one vendor.

# of Quotes per page:

Sort by:_@Ot_e_ Total

Total Item Count: 66 Total Awardable Quote Count: 9 Bid Status:
ltem 26-50 of 66
Index: 123

o Please make sure that you save your changes before you navigate to another page.

Cancel Item info/Quote info (ooo07912)Barnard  (00001398) MIDWEST
Instrument Repair MUSICAL
<Quote: IMPORTS
00006483> <Quote:
[Incomplete] 00006489>
French Bass Bow, 3/4 size, No Bid No Bid

Schultz NB NB
CARBNCMPBAGR3/4, New

Carbon Composite

Item #:26 Print

Sequence:26.0 Status:2BO

- Opened

Quantity:1.0 Uom:EA

Glockenspiel, Mattetech No Bid No Bid
MAL-G2.6 Octave Infinity NB NB
Item #:27 Print

Sequence:27.0 Status:2BO

- Opened

Quantity:1.0 Uom:EA

Mute, Harmon B Model No Bid No Bid
Aluminum Trumpet Wow- NB NB
Wow Mute

Iltem #:28 Print

Sequence:28.0 Status:2BO

V| |Ascending V|

2BO - Bid Opened (Quotes received and opened. Ready for tabulation)

(00003742)K&S
Music Inc
<Quote:
00006486>

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

Back to Bid

(00007336)Schultz {00007931)
Strings Inc Sweetwater Music
<Quote: Education
00006481> Technology
<Quote:
00006484>
® $110.00 No Bid
Discount: 0% NB
No Bid No Bid
NB NB
No Bid @ s$30.20
NB

[ ]
Discount: 0%

Basic Purchasing

Department Access

Page 1 of 5

Internal Administrator

November 23, 2021 7:48:50 AMcsT Q@ Z € @ = =

(00008148)Steve {00008233)
Weiss Music Washington Music
<Quote: Center
00006485> <Quote:
00006488>
No Bid No Bid
NB NB
O $1,989.00 No Bid
.. NB
Discount: 0%
No Bid O s$30.80
NB

Discount: 0%

(00010733)Music &
Arts Centers
<Quote:
00006487>

No Bid
NB

O $2,066.24
Discount: 0%

O $34.99
Discount: 0%

Kathy Kinley

{00005682)West
Music Company
Inc
<Quote:
00006482>

O $99.00
[ 1]
Discount: 0%
Alternate Description:
Krutz 8C
Add to Original |
Description
Replace Original
Description

® $1,995.00
Discount: 0%

O s$31.49
Discount: 0%



- Opened
Quantity:4.0 Uom:EA

Mouthpiece Adapter,
Trombone Small Shank to
Large Shank, Faxx FXA1656
Item #:29 Print
Sequence:29.0 Status:2BO
- Opened

Quantity:1.0 Uom:EA

Passive Speakers, JBL
JRX215 15, Two-Way
Passive Loudspeaker
System with 1,000 W Peak
Power Handling

Item #:30 Print
Sequence:30.0 Status:2BO
- Opened

Quantity:2.0 Uom:EA

Piano, Electric Yamaha CLP-
645 Yamaha Clavinova
including dolly installation
and delivery

Item #:31 Print
Sequence:31.0 Status:2BO
- Opened

Quantity:1.0 Uom:EA

Pitch Pipe, Kratt MK2
Chromatic Pitch Pipe Cto C
Item #:32 Print
Sequence:32.0 Status:2BO
- Opened

Quantity:1.0 Uom:EA

Saxophone Neck Strap with
Swivel Snap, Protech A310P
Item #:33 Print
Sequence:33.0 Status:2BO
- Opened

Quantity:3.0 Uom:EA

Speaker Stands (Set of 2)
with Carry Bag, Gator
Frameworks GFW-SPK-
2000SET, Standard
Aluminum

Item #:34 Print
Sequence:34.0 Status:2BO
- Opened

Quantity:1.0 Uom:PR

Suspended Cymbal Mallets,
Innovative INN-JC1SC

Item #:35 Print
Sequence:35.0 Status:2BO

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

O $269.00
Discount: 0%

No Bid
NB

O s30.70
Discount: 0%

No Bid
NB

O $132.60
Discount: 0%

QO $40.20
Discount: 0%

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

® s$28.00

Discount: 0%

® $25.00
=a
Discount: 0%

O s315.00
Discount: 0%

No Bid
NB

® 31925
[ 1]
Discount: 0%

O $17.95
Discount: 0%

O $145.00
Discount: 0%

O s$46.00
Discount: 0%

No Bid
NB

O $256.84
Discount: 0%

No Bid
NB

O s$24.99
Discount: 0%

® s9.82

[ ] ]
Discount: 0%

® $88.00
[ [ ]
Discount: 0%

O s$35.10
Discount: 0%

Page 2 of 5

O s26.95
Discount: 0%

® $251.75
[ 1]
Discount: 0%

® $3,895.99
=l
Discount: 0%
Alternate Description:
CLP-645
discontinued,now CLP-
745B
Add to Original
Description
Replace Original
Description

O s20.76
Discount: 0%

O s13.90
Discount; 0%

O s13727 |
Discount: 0%

O $39.00
Discount: 0%



- Opened
Quantity:2.0 Uom:PR

Tenor Saxophone, Accent
TS710L. with Mouthpiece,
Ligature, Case, &
Mouthpiece Cap

Item #:36 Print
Sequence:36.0 Status:2BO
- Opened

Quantity:3.0 Uom:EA

Timpani Mallets, Innovative
General Series GT

ltem #:37 Print
Sequence:37.0 Status:280
- Opened

Quantity:1.0 Uom:PR

Timpani Mallets, Vic Firth
American Custom T1
General

Item #:38 Print
Sequence:38.0 Status:2BO
- Opened

Quantity:1.0 Uom:PR

Timpani Mallets, Vic Firth
American Custom T3
Staccato

Item #:39 Print
Sequence:39.0 Status:2BO
- Opened

Quantity:1.0 Uom:PR

Timpani Mallets, Vic Firth
American Custom T4 Ultra
Staccato

Item #:40 Print
Sequence:40.0 Status:2BO
- Opened

Quantity:1.0 Uom:PR

Titan Speakers Field Frame,
Titan Muffs Lonestar
Percussion

Item #:41 Print
Sequence:41.0 Status:2BO
- Opened

Quantity:2.0 Uom:EA

Triangle, Sabian SAB-61135-
8B8H, 8" Hand Hammered
Triangle

Iltem #:42 Print
Sequence:42.0 Status:2BO
- Opened

Quantity:1.0 Uom:EA

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

O $905.00
1|
Discount: 0%
Alternate Description:
RS Berkeley TS5533

Add to Original

Description
Replace Original
Description
No Bid
NB
No Bid
NB
No Bid
NB
No Bid
NB
No Bid
NB
No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid.

NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

O $32.99
Discount: 0%

O $32.99
Discount: 0%

O s28.49
Discount: 0%

No Bid
NB

O $92.00
Discount: 0%

No Bid
NB

® 32000
F T 1
Discount: 0%

® s21.00
[T ]
Discount: 0%

® $21.00

[ L}
Discount: 0%

® 320,00

[T ]
Discount: 0%

O $889.00
Discount: 0%

QO s91.00
Discount: 0%

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

O $29.40

Discount: 0%

O $29.40
Discount: 0%

O 2745
Discount: 0%

O $1,185.00
Discount: 0%

QO s$74.00
Discount: 0%

No Bid
NB

O $20.06
Discount: 0%

O s27.93
Discount: 0%

O s27.93
Discount: 0%

O $25.24
Discount: 0%

® $830.99
[ [ |
Discount: 0%

® $72.24
-l
Discount: 0%

Page 3 of 5

® 3939.00
Discount: 0%

O s27.10
Discount: 0%

O $28.50
Discount: 0%

O $28.50
Discount: 0%

O s2580
Discount: 0%

O $950.00
Discount: 0%

O s88.00
Discount: 0%



Triangle Beaters, Grover
GRO-TBD, Grover Alloy 303
Deluxe Set with Case

Item #:43 Print
Sequence:43.0 Status:2BO
- Opened

Quantity:1.0 Uom:SET

Trombone, Accent TB512L
Item #:44 Print
Sequence:44.0 Status:2BO
- Opened

Quantity:4.0 Uom:EA

Trombone, Jupiter JTB730A
with Case and Mouthpiece
Item #:45 Print
Sequence:45.0 Status:2BO
- Opened

Quantity:2.0 Uom:EA

Mute, Trombone Cup Mute,
Humes & Berg 152 Tenor
Trombone Cup Mute

Item #:46 Print
Sequence:46.0 Status:2BO
- Opened

Quantity:4.0 Uom:EA

Trumpet, Accent TR514L,
with Mouthpiece & Case
Item #:47 Print
Sequence:47.0 Status:2BO
- Opened

Quantity:2.0 Uom:EA

Trumpet, Prelude by Conn-
Selmer TR711, with Case,
Bach 7C Mouthpiece &
Laquer

Item #:48 Print
Sequence:48.0 Status:2BO
- Opened

Quantity:2.0 Uom:EA

Mute, Trumpet Cup Mute,
Humes & Berg 102

Item #:49 Print
Senuenca:d9 0 Status:2RD

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

O s315.00
Discount: 0%

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

O $325.00
[ 1 ]
Discount: 0%
Alternate Description:
RS Berkeley TB703
Add to Original
Description
Replace Original
Description

O $325.00
[ ] ]
Discount: 0%
Alternate Description:
RS Berkeley TB703

Add to Original

Description
Replace Original
Description
No Bid
NB
O $285.00
[ 1]

Discount: 0%
Alternate Description:
RS Berkeley TP6540
Add to Original
Description
Replace Original
Description

O $285.00
L1
Discount: 0%
Alternate Description:
RS Berkeley TP6540
Add to Original
Description
Replace Original
Description

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

O s79.50
Discount: 0%

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

O $32.25
Discount: 0%

No Bid
NB

O s324.00
Discount: 0%

® s27.00
[ 1]
Discount: 0%

® 367.00
1]
Discount; 0%

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

O s95.00
Discount: 0%

No Bid
NB

® $393.00
Discount: 0%

O s$48.00
Discount: 0%

No Bid
NB

O s29265
Discount: 0%

O s40.95
Discount: 0%

Q s79.50
Discount: 0%

No Bid
NB

O 347553
Discount: 0%

® $29.94

[ 13
Discount: 0%

No Bid
NB

O $328.92
Discount: 0%

O $27.68
Discount: 0%

Page 4 of 5

O s75.00
Discount: 0%

® $391.00
Discount: 0%

O $456.00
Discount: 0%

O 33413
Discount: 0%

® s$368.00
Discount: 0% |

@® 3$309.00
Discount: 0%

O s$28.28
Discount: 0%



- Opened

Quantity:4.0 Uom:EA

Vibraphone Mallets, Mike No Bid
Balter BB5, Medium Birch NB

Item #:50 Print
Sequence:50.0 Status:2BO
- Opened

Quantity:1.0 Uom:PR

Totals: $Vendor Gross Total: $4,000.00
$ Vendor Discount: $0.00
$ Vendor Net Total: $4,000.00

$ Preference Discount: $0.00
$ Evaluation Total: s $4,000.00
$ Vendor Freight: $0.00
$ Awarded: $0.00
Eval Codes: Ni
Pref Codes:
Award/Unaward All: | Award AII_ o

Unaward All |

No Bid
NB

$16,710.00
$0.00
$16,710.00
$0.00
$16,710.00
$0.00
$0.00

NI

Award Al |
Unaward All

Evaluation Code Descriptions:
=a = Lowest ltem Price or Lowest Evaluation Quote Total NB = No Bid
Ni = Did Not Bid All ltems

B A(ward All
Unaward All

No Bid No Bid
NB NB
$19,036.00 $21,490.12
$0.00 $0.00
$19,036.00 $21,490.12
$0.00 $0.00
$19,036.00 $21,490.12
$0.00 $0.00
$110.00 $228.80
NI Ni

o Award All

Unaward All

| |  Saves Continue R |

Copyright © 2021 Periscope_Holdings, Inc. - All Rig

hts Reserved. defaulit

® $16.00

[ ]
Discount: 0%

$21,926.00
$0.00
$21,926.00
$0.00
$21,926.00
$0.00
$221.00

NI

Award All
Unaward All |

O $25.15
Discount: 0%

O $19.23
Discount: 0%

Page 5 of 5

O s18.15
Discount: 0%

$32,525.30 $40,549.46 $64,028.48
$0.00 $0.00 $0.00
$32,525.30 $40,549.46 $64,028.48
$0.00 $0.00 $0.00
$32,525.30 $40,549.46 $64,028.48
$0.00 $0.00 $0.00
$830.25 $1,989.44 $12,12049 |
NI NI
|
 Award Al | Award Al  AwadAl |
Unaward All Unaward All Unaward All




N\

% Cedar Rapids
! Community School District

NIGP Code Browse | My Account | Customer Service | About

Home ltems

Documents

Vendors

Bid Tabulation for Bid #00001478

Quotes

Revisions Items

Header Questions

o "Each bid items can only be awarded to one vendor.

# of Quotes per page; 100 Vv

Total Item Count:

Item
Index:

66

51-66 of 66
123

Sortby| Quote Total | [Ascending V|

Total Awardable Quote Count:

Subcontractors Routing Attachments Score

9 Bid Status:

|
0 Please make sure that you save your changes before you navigate to another page.

Cancel

Item info/Quote info

Vibraphone Mallets, Mike
Balter BB24, Hard Birch
ftem #:51 Print
Sequence:51.0 Status:2BO
- Opened

Quantity:1.0 Uom:PR

Viraphone Mallets, Mike
Balter BB6, Soft Birch

ltem #:52  Print
Sequence:52.0 Status:2BO
- Opened

Quantity:1.0 Uom:PR

Viola, 15.5" Schultz
SSPS103VA155, Performer
Series 103 with Case

Item #:53 Print
Sequence:53.0 Status:2BO
- Opened

Quantity:1.0 Uom:EA

(00007912)Barnard
Instrument Repair
<Quote:
00006483>
[Incomplete]

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

(00001398)MIDWEST
MUSICAL
IMPORTS

<Quote:
00006489>
[Incomplete]

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

Current Organization: Cedar Rapids Community School District &=

Quick Buy

Summary

2BO - Bid Opened (Quotes received and opened. Ready for tabulation)

(00003742)K&S
Music Inc
<Quote:
00006486>

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

O $245.00
[ 1]
Discount: 0%
Alternate Description:
Meisel Mozart 7195VA
Add to Original
Description

Back to Bid

(00007336)Schultz

Strings Inc
<Quote:
00006481>

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

® 3770.00
Discount: 0%

(00007931)

Sweetwater Music

Education

Technology

<Quote:
00006484>

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

(00008148)Steve
Weiss Music
<Quote:
00006485>

® $17.00
[ ]
Discount: 0%

® $16.00
[ [ ]
Discount: 0%

No Bid
NB

Basic Purchasing

Department Access

Page 1 of 4

Internal Administrator

November 23, 2021 7:49:06 AMCcsT Q@ Ml Z € T = [

{00008233)
Washington Music
Center
<Quote:
00006488>

O $26.30
Discount: 0%

O s25.15
Discount: 0%

No Bid
NB

(00010733)Music &
Arts Centers
<Quote:
00006487>

O s19.23
Discount: 0%

O s$190.14
Discount: 0%

No Bid
NB

Kathy Kinley

(00005682)West
Music Company
Inc
<Quote:
00006482>

O $19.20

Discount: 0%

O s18.15
Discount: 0%

O s$425.00

Discount: 0%
Alternate Description:
Two Rivers 100 Series
Add to Original
Description
Replace Original
Description



Viola, 15" Schultz No Bid
SSPS103VA15, Performer NB
Series 103 with Case

Item #:54 Print
Sequence:54.0 Status:2BO
- Opened

Quantity:1.0 Uom:EA

Viola, 16" Schul&z Strings No Bid
Performer Series 102 Outfit, NB
Pro Arte Strings, Carbon

Composite Bow, Dark

Shaped Woodshell Ca...View

Detail

Item #:55 Print

Sequence:55.0 Status:2BO

- Opened

Quantity:1.0 Uom:EA

Violin Bow, 3/4 size, Schultz No Bid
CARBNCMPVN43, Carbon NB
Composite

Item #:56 Print
Sequence:56.0 Status:2BO
- Opened

Quantity:10.0 Uom:EA

Violin Bow, 4/4 size, Schultz No Bid
CARBNCMPVN44, NB
Refurbished SSPS101

Carbon Composite

Item #:57 Print
Sequence:57.0 Status:2BO
- Opened

Quantity:13.0 Uom:EA

Violin Case, 3/4 size, Schultz No Bid
SHAPEDV43, Dart Woodshell NB
SSPS102VN Case

Item #:58 Print

Sequence:58.0 Status:2BO

- Opened

Quantity:5.0 Uom:EA

Violin Case, 4/4 size, Schultz No Bid
SHAPEDV44, Dart Shaped NB
Woodshell

Item #:59 Print
Sequence:59.0 Status:2BO

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

Replace QOriginal
Description

O $245.00
[ 1 ]
Discount: 0%
Alternate Description:
Meisel Mozart 7195VA
Add to Original
Description
Replace Original
Description

O $245.00

[T

Discount: 0%
Alternate Description:
Meisel Mozart 7195VA

Add to Original

Description
Replace Original
Description
No Bid
NB
No Bid
NB
No Bid
NB
No Bid
NB

® s$770.00
Discount: 0%

® 3$620.00
Discount: 0%

® $50.00
Discount: 0%

® $40.00
Discount: 0%

® 3$80.00
Discount; 0%

® $80.00
Discount: 0%

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

Page 2 of 4

O sa25.00

Discount: 0%
Alternate Description:
Two Rivers 100 Series
Add to Original
Description
Replace Original
Description

O s485.00

Discount: 0%
Alternate Description:
Two Rivers 100 Series
Add to Original
Description
Replace Original
Description

O $39.00
[ 1]
Discount: 0%
Alternate Description:
Krutz
Add to Original
Description
Replace Original
Description

O $39.00
[ 1]
Discount: 0%
Alternate Description:
Krutz, New
Add to Original
Description
Replace Original
Description

O $70.00
[ 1]
Discount: 0%
Alternate Description:
Eastman CA1304
Add to Original
Description
Replace Original
Description

O s70.00
[ 1]
Discount: 0%
Alternate Description:
Eastman CA1304



- Opened
Quantity:20.0 Uom:EA

Violin, 3/4 size, Schultz
Strings Performer Series 102
Outfit

Iltem #:60 Print
Sequence:60.0 Status:2BO
- Opened

Quantity:8.0 Uom:EA

Violin, 4/4 size, Schultz
Performer Series102 Outfit,
Dart Woodshell Shaped
Case, Prelude Strings

Item #:61 Print
Sequence:61.0 Status:2BO
- Opened

Quantity:11.0 Uom:EA

Violin, 4/4 size, Schultz
Performer Series 102 Outfit,
Pro Arte Strings, Carbon
Composite Bow, Dart
Shaped Woodshell
Cas...View Detail

Item #:62 Print
Sequence:62.0 Status:2BO
- Opened

Quantity:3.0 Uom:EA

Keyboard Stand, X-Style, On-
Stage KS8190

ltem #:63 Print
Sequence:63.0 Status:2BO
- Opened

Quantity:1.0 Uom:EA

Xylophone Mallets, Mike
Balter General

Item #:64 Print
Sequence:64.0 Status:2BO
- Opened

Quantity:4.0 Uom:PR

Yamaha HD-300 Harmony
Director, Yamaha HD-200
Item #:65 Print
Sequence:65.0 Status:2BO
- Opened

Quantity:1.0 Uom:EA

Yamaha Soft Case for
Harmony Director, Yamaha
YAC-SCHD

Item #:66 Print

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

O $205.00
nl
Discount: 0%
Alternate Description:
Meisel Mozart 6105A
Add to Original
Description
Replace Original
Description

O $229.00
Wil
Discount: 0%
Alternate Description:
Meisel Mozart 6105A
Add to Original
Description
Replace Original
Description

O $269.00
[ 1]
Discount; 0%
Alternate Description:
Meisel Mozart 6105A

Add to Original

Description
Replace Original
Description
No Bid
NB
No Bid
NB
No Bid
NB
No Bid
NB

® $460.00
Discount: 0%

® $460.00
Discount: 0%

@® $460.00

Discount: 0%

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

@ s333.00
[ 1]
Discount: 0%

No Bid
NB

O $546.00
Discount: 0%

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

O s65.00
Discount: 0%

No Bid
NB

® $545.00
T3
Discount: 0%

® $44.00
[ ]
Discount: 0%

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

No Bid
NB

O $39.08
Discount: 0%

No Bid
NB

O s600.00
Discount: 0%

O s14063
Discount: 0%

Page 3 of 4

Add to Original
Description
Replace Original
Description

O s345.00

Discount: 0%
Alternate Description:
Two Rivers 100 Series
Add to Original
Description
Replace Original
Description

O $345.00

Discount: 0%
Alternate Description:
Two Rivers 100 Series
Add to Original
Description
Replace Original
Description

QO $345.00

Discount: 0%
Alternate Description:
Two Rivers 100 Series
Add to Original
Description
Replace Original
Description

O s30.95
Discount: 0%

® s$13.90

[ 1]
Discount: 0%

O $700.00
Discount: 0%

O s112.50
Discount: 0%



Sequence:66.0 Status:2BO

- Opened

Quantity:1.0 Uom:EA

Totals: $Vendor Gross Total:
$ Vendor Discount;
$ Vendor Net Total:
$ Preference Discount:
$ Evaluation Total:
$ Vendor Freight:
$ Awarded:

Eval Codes:
Pref Codes:

Award/Unaward All:

Evaluation Code Descriptions:
e = Lowest Item Price or Lowest Evaluation Quote Total NB = No Bid
Ni = Did Not Bid All items

Unaward All

$4,000.00
$0.00
$4,000.00
$0.00

== $4,000.00
$0.00

$0.00

NI

Award All

—

Page 4 of 4

$9,057.00 $16,710.00 $19,036.00 $21,490.12 $21,926.00 $32,526.30 $40,549.46 $64,028.48
$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
$9,057.00 $16,710.00 $19,036.00 $21,490.12 $21,926.00 $32,525.30 $40,549.46 $64,028.48
$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
$9,057.00 $16,710.00 $19,036.00 $21,490.12 $21,926.00 $32,625.30 $40,549.46 $64,028.48
$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00 $15,300.00 $33.00 $33.00 $589.00 $0.00 $55.60
NI NI NI NI NI NI NI
Award Al | | Award Al Award Al | Award All Award Al | AwadAl | Award Al | Award Al |
Unaward All | | Unaward All | | Unaward Ali ' Unaward Ali | Unaward Ali | Unaward All | Unaward All | Unaward All |

Copyright © 2021 Periscope Holdings, Inc. - All Rights Reserved. default

_‘ { ﬂ <_&_Continue :




